
 

City Council Meeting Highlights 
Wednesday, February 14, 2024 

 

Summary of the actions taken at the City Council meeting 
 

 
Ordinance No. 2024-616  
First reading of Ordinance to 
establish a policy regulating 
Alcoholic Beverages in public 
places. The proposed ordinance 
will continue to prohibit open 
containers, service (including 
sale), and consumption of 
alcohol in public places, but 
creates a new regulatory process 
which will allow an individual to 
obtain an Administrative Alcohol 
Permit if there is an event in a 
public place at which alcohol will 
be served and consumed and 
meets various requirements. 

CITY ATTORNEY  

 
Warrants Processed 
Received and filed warrants 
processed during the period of 
January 13, 2024 to February 2, 
2024. 

FINANCE  

 
Resolution No. 003-2024 
Adopted the City of Hawaiian 
Gardens 2024 Title VI Program 
Update per Federal Transit 
Administration Title VI 
requirements and guidelines for 
federally funded subrecipients. 
 
Traffic Survey Contract 
Awarded a contract to Minagar 
& Associates, Inc., for 
preparation of the Citywide 
Engineering and Traffic Survey 
report. 

PUBLIC WORKS 

 

View Staff Reports and Meeting Video HERE 
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